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12 OZ WHITE FOAM CUP 1000/CASE No Quote 1000/CASE #DCC12J12 No Quote 1000/CASE No Quote 1000/CASE BUN2272 No Quote 1000/CASE  No Quote 1000/CASE  No Quote 

9 OZ. COLD DRINK CUPS 2500/CASE No Quote 2500/CASE #BWKTRN59 No Quote 2500/CASE No Quote 2500/CASE No Quote 2500/CASE No Quote 2500/CASE No Quote

ANGLE SWEEP BROOM EACH No Quote EACH ABCO #BR1024MH No Quote
12" w steel 

handle
EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH BR1024M 3.98 EA 12/case Full case only EACH No Quote

BLEND BUDDY FOR H2ORANGE2 EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote

CAN LINERS 33" X 40"  33 GAL HI-D 16 MICRONS 250/CASE CP334016 $14.80 250/CASE No Quote  250/CASE  No Quote 250/CASE BUN2510 $16.27 250/CASE  No Quote 250/CASE $15.90 

CAN LINERS 33" X 40"  HI-D 16 MICRONS 250/CASE CP334016 $14.80 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE
PAL334016

W
No Quote 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE $15.90

CASCADE LIQUID DISHWASHER DETERGENT 20 OZ/EA No Quote 20 OZ/EA No Quote 20 OZ/EA No Quote 20 OZ/EA No Quote 20 OZ/EA No Quote 20 OZ/EA No Quote

CLEAR CAN LINERS 8-10 GALLON FOR #2956 CAN 250/CASE CP10GN $19.20 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE No Quote 250/CASE No Quote

DUST PANS 12” EACH No Quote EACH #4212 No Quote steel    EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH FG2005 1.99 EA 6/case   Plastic Full case only EACH No Quote

DUST PANS 16” EACH No Quote EACH IMPACT                    
#4216

No Quote steel EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH 4216 6.99 EA 6/case   Steel Full case only EACH No Quote

DUSTING BRUSHES 8” GRAY FIBER EACH No Quote EACH ABCO                      
#00100

No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH 102 3.49 Ea 6/case Full case only EACH No Quote

EN MOTION ROLL TOWELS 6 ROLLS/CASE 816B No Quote 6 ROLLS/CASE No Quote 6 ROLLS/CASE No Quote 6 ROLLS/CASE JAME132 No Quote 6 ROLLS/CASE  No Quote 6 ROLLS/CASE  No Quote 

EN MOTION TOWEL DISPENSER EACH 1080E No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote

EXTEND TO REACH DUSTER EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH 470380 $3.99 48"-82" ext EACH No Quote

FINISH MOP HEAD EACH No Quote EACH ABCO 
LM203MCSNB

No Quote med. Size EACH No Quote EACH BUNZ1016 No Quote EACH LM203MCSN $3.69  6/case Full case only EACH  No Quote 

FURNITURE POLISH FOR WOOD/FORMICA/VINYL 12/CASE No Quote 12/CASE CHASE                
#433-4109

No Quote Aerosol 12/CASE No Quote 12/CASE No Quote 12/CASE 4109 $32.98 12/case 12/CASE No Quote

GARAGE PUSH BROOM WITH HANDLE (HEAVY DUTY) EACH No Quote EACH ABCO                
#BH12007+01102

No Quote 24" wide EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH 120224 $6.98 24" w EACH No Quote

H2ORANGE2 CONCENTRATE CLEANER 4 GALLONS/CASE No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE ENVI1 No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE  No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE  No Quote 

KIMBERLY CLARK KLEENEX C FOLD TOWEL WHITE 2400/CASE No Quote 2400/CASE No Quote 2400/CASE No Quote 2400/CASE KIMB52 No Quote 2400/CASE  No Quote 2400/CASE  No Quote 

KLING CLINGING TOILET BOWEL CLEANER 12 QUARTS/CASE No Quote 12 QUARTS/CASE No Quote 12 QUARTS/CASE No Quote 12 QUARTS/CASE BETC65 No Quote 12 QUARTS/CASE  No Quote 12 QUARTS/CASE  No Quote 

LAMBS WOOL DUSTER EACH No Quote EACH LAMBSKIN     
#S24PPD

No Quote 24" L EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH 524PPD $2.98 EACH No Quote

LIQUID DISHWASHING SOAP 50 OZ/6/CASE No Quote 50 OZ/6/CASE No Quote 50 OZ/6/CASE No Quote 50 OZ/6/CASE No Quote 50 OZ/6/CASE No Quote 50 OZ/6/CASE No Quote

LIQUID LAUNDRY DETERGENT GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE 117790 $46.80 GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote

MAJESTIC EXTRACTION CLEANER GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE 121557 $80.80 GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote

MAJESTIC TRIPLE ACTION SPOTTER DEODORIZER GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote GALLON/4/CASE No Quote

MULTIFOLD NATURAL PAPER TOWEL 4000/CASE P200N $17.60 4000/CASE No Quote 4000/CASE No Quote 4000/CASE SUSQ301 $18.98 4000/CASE  No Quote 4000/CASE  No Quote 

PAIL PUMP EACH No Quote EACH TOLCO                          
#160108

No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH No Quote

SCENTED HAND SOAP WITH LOTION 4 GALLON No Quote 4 GALLON No Quote 4 GALLON No Quote 4 GALLON No Quote 4 GALLON No Quote 4 GALLON No Quote

SCOTT 10 WYPALL L40 WIPES CASE No Quote CASE WYPALL KCC05701 No Quote 1000/cs CASE No Quote CASE SCOT10 No Quote CASE  No Quote CASE  No Quote 

SCRUB BRUSH EACH No Quote EACH ABCO                           
#00027 

No Quote Iron Style EACH No Quote EACH No Quote EACH 27 $0.99 6" L             
Ironstyle

EACH No Quote

SCRUBBING SPONGES 6.1” X 3.6” 20/CASE No Quote 20/CASE HYDRA                       
#70CHD-20

No Quote 20/CASE No Quote 20/CASE No Quote 20/CASE 70CSD-20 $10.98 20/CASE No Quote

SPONGES 5 1/4 X 3 5/8 X 1 1/2 6/CASE No Quote 6/CASE HYDRA                       
#W1PKG 

No Quote 6/CASE No Quote 6/CASE MICR143 No Quote 24/case 6/CASE WIPK $2.94 6/CASE  No Quote 

SPONGES 5 1/4 X 3 5/8 X 2 6/CASE No Quote 6/CASE HYDRA                        
#W2PKG 

 No Quote 6/CASE  No Quote 6/CASE No Quote 6/CASE W2PK $4.74 6/CASE  No Quote 

SPRAY NINE AEROSOL GLASS & STAINLESS CLEANER EACH No Quote EACH #ITW23319  No Quote EACH  No Quote EACH No Quote EACH 4111P $2.99 EACH  No Quote 

TOILET BOWL CLEANER/BRUSH CADDIE EACH No Quote EACH Impact                    
#150

 No Quote EACH  No Quote EACH No Quote EACH 150 $1.98 EACH  No Quote 

TOILET BRUSH ANGLE HEAD EACH No Quote EACH ABCO                   
#BH18001

 No Quote EACH  No Quote EACH No Quote EACH 17 $1.19 EACH  No Quote 

TOILET BRUSH STRAIGHT HEAD EACH No Quote EACH RUBBERMAID   
FG6310

 No Quote EACH  No Quote EACH No Quote EACH 6310 $1.39 EACH  No Quote 

TOILET TISSUE (JUMBO 9” 2-PLY WITH 3.3” CORE) 12/CASE 700 $24.00 12/CASE RUBBERMAID        
#FG6310

 No Quote 12/CASE  No Quote 12/CASE PEER98 $23.28 12/CASE  No Quote 12/CASE  No Quote 

TOILET TISSUE 2-PLY SMALL 96/CASE 235 $43.70 96/CASE  No Quote 96/CASE  No Quote 96/CASE SUSQ103 $33.44 96/CASE  No Quote 96/CASE  No Quote 

URINAL BLOCK SCENTED WITH SCREEN EACH  12/pk No Quote EACH  12/pk
CENTINENTAL   

#165-4
 No Quote EACH  12/pk 108201  $               69.66 EACH  12/pk FRES9 $24.27 EACH  12/pk $11.98 EACH  12/pk  No Quote 

Email:  asilverstrim@susquehannapaper.com Email: prosupply26@yahoo.com

PRO SUPPLY

 Rep: Anthony Delmastro
 Phone: 570-659-1004

 Fax: 570-300-3131

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP UNIPAK CORP.SUSQUEHANNA PAPER & SANITARY SUPPLYSTATE INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS

Rep:  Kenneth Miller
Phone: 800-792-2644 x225

FAX:  813-621-7688

PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS

 Rep:  Jennifer Luckenbill Rep: Andy Silverstrim
Phone: 570-916-2046        

Fax: 570-323-3189 Fax:  718-677-9371
 Email: customercare@unipakcorp.net

#121418C/OLYC 
This number 

must be listed on 
all orders placed.

Vendor Contact Information

 Janitorial Supply Quote Summary
October 1, 2020 -  December 31, 2020

Resource Management Services

 Rep:  Nicole Lawson
 Phone: 908-862-7570

 Fax: 908-862-9019
 Email: bids@centralpoly.com  Email:  biddept@pyramidsp.com

 Phone:  570-337-8527
 Fax: 800-782-2436

 Email:  jluckenbill@stateindustrial.com

Rep: Brian Marcus
Phone: 888-808-5120
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7-7/8” x 1000 ft. Hard Wound White Roll Paper Towels 6/Case P708B  $          19.60 6/Case 6-800W  $          19.50 6/Case  No Quote 6/Case  No Quote 6/Case SUSQ202  $                 18.98 6/Case  No Quote 

Can Liner (24 X 32 X 8 Micron HDPE)
50 Bags/Roll 20 

Rolls/Case
CP243308  $          18.40 

50 Bags/Roll 20 
Rolls/Case

24-33-8  $          25.60 
50 Bags/Roll 20 

Rolls/Case
 No Quote 

50 Bags/Roll 20 
Rolls/Case

 No Quote 
50 Bags/Roll 20 

Rolls/Case
IWTP 12  $                 23.61 

50 Bags/Roll 20 
Rolls/Case

 $          18.50 

Can Liner (40 x 48 x 16  Micron HDPE)
25 Bags/Roll 10 

Rolls/Case
CP404816  $          25.60 

25 Bags/Roll 10 
Rolls/Case

40-48-16  $          25.60 
25 Bags/Roll 10 

Rolls/Case
 No Quote 

25 Bags/Roll 10 
Rolls/Case

 No Quote 
25 Bags/Roll 10 

Rolls/Case
IWTP 19  $                 27.27 

25 Bags/Roll 10 
Rolls/Case

 $          21.75 

Toilet Tissue 2 Ply 3.5” x4.5” 500 sheet/roll  >33lb./case > 54 sq 
ft/roll

96/case A235  $          43.70 96/case 585960  $          32.75 96/case  No Quote 96/case  No Quote 96/case SUSQ103  No Quote 96/case  No Quote 

Email: biddept@pyramidsp.com

Rep: Brian Marcus
Phone: 888-808-5120

Fax:  718-677-9371
 Email: customercare@unipakcorp.net

Rep: Andy Silverstrim
Phone: 570-916-2046       

Fax: 570-323-3189
Email:  asilverstrim@susquehannapaper.com

Vendor Contact Information

Pyramid School ProductsCENTRAL POLY BAG CORP STATE INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS

Janitorial Supply Quote Summary
October 1, 2020 - December 31, 2020

Prison

 Rep:  Nicole Lawson

PRO SUPPLY Unipak CorpSUSQUEHANNA PAPER & SANITARY SUPPLY

 Phone: 908-862-7570
 Fax: 908-862-9019

 Email: bids@centralpoly.com

 Rep: Anthony Delmastro
 Phone: 570-659-1004

 Fax: 570-300-3131
 Email: prosupply26@yahoo.com

 Phone:  570-337-8527
 Fax: 800-782-2436

 Rep:  Jennifer LuckenbillRep: Kenneth Miller
Phone:  800-792-2644 ext 225

Fax: 813-621-7688
 Email:  jluckenbill@stateindustrial.com
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BROWN MULTIFOLD TOWELS  MIN CASE WEIGHT 18.54 LBS 4000/CASE P200N $16.99 4000/CASE 200 $14.55 4000/CASE No Quote 1000/CASE SUSQ301 $13.79 4000/CASE No Bid 4000/CASE No Bid

BROWN ROLL TOWELS   7 7/8"X600'-2"CORE  MIN CASE WEIGHT 
33.0LBS NET WT

12 ROLLS/CASE P726N $27.99 12 ROLLS/CASE 12600 $25.60 12 ROLLS/CASE No Quote 2500/CASE BERK10 $26.04 12 ROLLS/CASE No Bid 12 ROLLS/CASE No Bid

CAN LINER BAGS (24"X33")   8 MICRONS CASE WEIGHT- MIN 16.8 
LBS NET WT.

20 ROLLS/50 
BAGS/CASE

CP243308 $19.40 
20 ROLLS/50 
BAGS/CASE

24338 $25.60 
20 ROLLS/50 
BAGS/CASE

No Quote
20Rolls/50 
Bags/Case

INTP 12 $23.61 11.6 lbs.
20 ROLLS/50 
BAGS/CASE

No Bid
20 ROLLS/50 
BAGS/CASE

243308 $18.50 

CAN LINER BAGS (30"X37") 13MICRONS CASE WEIGHT -MIN 19.4 
LBS NET WT.

20 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

CP303713 $18.80 
20 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

303716 $27.40 
20 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

No Quote
20Rolls/25     
Bags/Case

INTP 3 $26.50 15.9 lbs.
20 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

No Bid
20 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

303713 $20.90 

CAN LINER BAGS (38"X60") 17 MICRONS CASE WEIGHT -MIN 20.9 
LBS NET WT.

8 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

CP386017 $22.40 
8 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

No Quote
8 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

No Quote
8Rolls/25    
Bags/Case

INTP 4 $29.95 17.5 lbs.
8 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

No Bid
8 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

386017 $22.50 

CAN LINER BAGS (40"X48") 16 MICRONS CASE WEIGHT -MIN 20.7 
LBS NET WT.

10 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

CP404816 $24.50 
10 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

404816 $25.60 
10 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

No Quote
10Rolls/25       
Bags/Case

INTP 19 $27.95 17.3 lbs.
10 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

No Bid
10 ROLLS/25 
BAGS/CASE

404816 $21.75 

GLOVES-NITRILE- EMERALD EXAM P-FREE min 4mil-X LARGE 100BX/10BX/CASE No Quote 100BX/10BX/CASE NITXL No Quote 100BX/10BX/CASE No Quote 100BX/10BX/case No Quote 100BX/10BX/CASE NKL400 $119.00 100BX/10BX/CASE NPF $175.00 

GLOVES-NITRILE- EMERALD EXAM P-FREE min 4mil- LARGE 100BX/10BX/CASE No Quote 100BX/10BX/CASE NITL No Quote 100BX/10BX/CASE No Quote 100BX/10BX/case No Quote 100BX/10BX/CASE NLG400 $119.00 100BX/10BX/CASE NPF $175.00 

GLOVES VINYL/POWDER FREE-EXAM QUALITY -5 MIL-XLARGE 100 BX/10 BX/CASE No Quote 100 BX/10 BX/CASE 9709 No Quote 100 BX/10 BX/CASE No Quote EACH No Quote
100 BX/10 
BX/CASE

VKL5201 $79.90 
100 BX/10 
BX/CASE

VPF $125.00 

GLOVES VINYL/POWDER FREE-EXAM QUALITY-5MIL-LARGE 100 BX/10 BX/CASE  No Quote 100 BX/10 BX/CASE 9708  No Quote 100 BX/10 BX/CASE No Quote EACH No Quote
100 BX/10 
BX/CASE

VLG5201 $79.90 
100 BX/10 
BX/CASE

VPF $125.00 

GOJO FOAM SOAP- LUXURY FOAM HANDWASH 2-1500ML/CASE  No Quote 2-1500ML/CASE 8561  No Quote 2-1500ML/CASE No Quote EACH No Quote 2-1500ML/CASE  No Bid 2-1500ML/CASE No Bid

NEUTRAL FLOOR CLEANER CONCENTRATE- LEMON OR NEUTRAL 
SCENT

4 GALLONS/CASE  No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE AP7  $              22.40 4 GALLONS/CASE 121385 $30.53 6 ROLLS/CASE No Quote 4 GALLONS/CASE  No Bid 4 GALLONS/CASE No Bid

TOILET TISSUE (2-PLY 500 SHEETS-MIN 4.0"X3.5") -34.0 LBS MIN 
CASE WT.

96 ROLL/CASE A235  $              44.00 96 ROLL/CASE 58596  $              32.75 96 ROLL/CASE No Quote EACH SUSQ 110 $31.39 96 ROLL/CASE  No Bid 96 ROLL/CASE No Bid

TOILET TISSUE (2-PLY JUMBO JUNIOR ROLL-9" -1000FT/ROLL ) 22.0 
LBS MIN CASE WT

12 ROLLS/CASE A700  $              24.00 12 ROLLS/CASE TTJJ  $              22.75 12 ROLLS/CASE No Quote EACH PEER98 $22.77 12 ROLLS/CASE  No Bid 12 ROLLS/CASE No Bid

WHITE ROLL TOWELS 7 7/8" X800'-2"DIA CORE-MIN CASE WT 26.88 
LBS

6 ROLLS/CASE P708B  $              19.73 6 ROLLS/CASE 6-800W  $              19.50 6 ROLLS/CASE No Quote EACH SUSQ202 $18.69 6 ROLLS/CASE  No Bid 6 ROLLS/CASE No Bid

Vendor Contact Information

 Email: bids@centralpoly.com
 Fax: 908-862-9019

 Phone: 908-862-7570
 Rep:  Nicole Lawson

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP SUSQUEHANNA PAPER & SANITARY SUPPLYSTATE INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS

 Phone: 570-659-1004
 Fax: 570-300-3131

 Janitorial Supply Quote Summary
October 1, 2020 - December 31, 2020

Courthouse, Executive Plaza, Third Street Plaza, Lysock View Complex & Pre-Release Center

 Rep: Anthony Delmastro

PRO SUPPLY

 Rep:  Jennifer Luckenbill Rep: Andy Silverstrim

Fax:  813-621-7688
 Email:  biddept@pyramidsp.com

Fax:  718-677-9371
 Email: customercare@unipakcorp.net

 Fax: 800-782-2436
 Email:  jluckenbill@stateindustrial.com

Fax: 570-323-3189
Email:  asilverstrim@susquehannapaper.com

 Phone:  570-337-8527

 Email: prosupply26@yahoo.com

Phone: 570-916-2046        

UNIPAK CORP.PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS

Rep:  Brian Marcus
Phone: 888-808-5120

Rep: Kenneth Miller
Phone:  800-792-2644  x225
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