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ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT FEESERS, INC KEYCO DIST. 
INC

SYSCO 
CENTRAL PA

BEVERAGE

1 Apple Juice, Imperial, 0% 1 - 3 gal                 
4 - 1 gal $44.51 NO BID NO BID

2 Cherry Juice Base, Best Value 4 - 1 gal NO BID $39.95 NO BID

3 Grape Juice Base, Best Value 4 - 1 gal NO BID $39.95 NO BID

4 Grapefruit Juice, Imperial, 0% 1 - 3 gal                    
4 - 1 gal $51.19 NO BID NO BID

5 Iced Tea Base, Best Value 4 - 1 gal NO BID $22.05 NO BID

6 Lemon Juice Base, Best Value 4 - 1 gal NO BID $39.95 NO BID

7 Lemon Juice, Concentrate, Plastic 12 - 32 oz $25.23 $23.70 $24.96

8 Orange Juice, Concentrate, Frozen, 100% Pure 
Pasteurized 12 - 32 oz $31.17 $32.05 $52.12

9 Orange Juice Base, Best Value 4 - 1 gal NO BID $39.95 NO BID

10 Orange Juice, Breakfast Blend, Imperial 1 -  5 gal $62.48 NO BID NO BID

11 Punch Juice Base, Best Value 4 - 1 gal NO BID $42.10 NO BID

12 So, Base, Iced Tea, Preswt, Best Value 4 - 1 gal NO BID $22.05 NO BID

13 So, Base, Iced Tea, Preswt, Imperial 1 - 5 gal                          
5-1 mix $58.41 NO BID NO BID

14 So, Base, Jce, Grape, Imperial 1 - 5 gal                         
5-1 mix $63.48 NO BID NO BID

15 So, Syrup, Jce, Punch, Imperial 1 - 5 gal/ 100% $63.38 NO BID NO BID

16 Syrup, Jce, Orange, Nat, Brkf, Imperial 1 - 3 gal / 100%             
3-1 mix $60.47 NO BID NO BID

17 Syrup, Jce, Orange, Nat, Brkf, Imperial 1 - 5 gal/ 100% $93.30 NO BID NO BID

CANNED FRUIT

18 Apple Sauce, Domestic and Imported Grade A 
(Fancy) 6 - #10 $19.50 $20.45 $19.49

19 Mandarin Oranges 6 - #10 $25.50 $25.35 $49.09

20 Peach, Slices, Grade A
6 - #10             

Irregular 
Standard Pack

$34.81 $32.40 $44.27

21 Pear, Slices, Standard Pack Grade A 6 - #10 $33.47 $31.30 $48.70

The prices highlighted in red indicate the food product to be supplied and delivered by Feesers Inc., 
Keyco Distributors and Sysco Central PA to the County of Lycoming for the period of October 1, 2020, 
through December 31, 2020.  Vendors must provide weekly pricing, unless a price has been provided, 
on the food products listed below as "WEEKLY QUOTE".  A price comparison will then be done among 
vendors  and the lowest priced vendor will be awarded.
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22 Pineapple, Tidbits, Nat Jce 6 - #10 $23.87 $26.75 $26.88

CANNED GOODS

24 Soup, Tomato, Conc 1 – 1 12 - 48 oz $29.08 $37.45 $28.95

25 Soup, Celery, Conc 1 – 1  12 - 48 oz $35.04 $47.80 $34.85

26 Soup, Chicken Noodle, Conc 2 – 1 12 - 48 oz $34.19 $44.20 $34.15

27 Soup, Mushroom, Conc 2 – 1 12- 48 oz $38.18 $48.55 $38.02

28 Tomato, Paste, Grade A 6 - #10          
Standard Pack $36.75 $34.95 $34.61

29 Tomato, Sauce, Grade A 6 - #10          
Standard Pack $19.25 $18.94 $22.94

30 Beans, Green, Grade A 6 - #10          
Standard Pack $21.02 $24.45 $25.36

31 Beans, Wax , Grade A 6 - #10          
Standard Pack $28.08 $30.20 $31.01

CEREAL/BREAKFAST

32 Apple Jacks, Hospitality 1 - 20# $37.13 Weekly Quote $36.30

33 Bran Flakes, Hospitality 1  -20# $15.90 Weekly Quote $17.53

34 Bunch O Crunch, Hospitality 1 - 20# $16.45 Weekly Quote $30.28

35 Coco Munchies, Hospitality 1 - 20# $40.41 Weekly Quote $17.96

36 Corn Flakes, Hospitality 1 - 20# $14.55 Weekly Quote $14.52

37 Frosted Flakes, Hospitality 1 - 20# $24.55 Weekly Quote $17.23

38 Pancakes 144 ct -  .99 oz $23.05 $19.23 $19.21

39 Quickoats 12 - 42 oz $30.80 Weekly Quote $29.38

40 Rice Krispies, Hospitality 1 - 20# $19.18 Weekly Quote $16.97

41 Toasted Oats, Hospitality 1 - 20# $17.74 Weekly Quote $15.64

42 Waffles 144 ct - 1.25 oz $16.50 $21.90 $16.37

CONDIMENTS

43 Ketchup, 33% Solid, V 6 - 10# $22.70 $22.60 $22.78

44 Ketchup, Packets 500/9gm $17.92 $11.32 $11.30

45 Mayonnaise, Heavy 4 - 1 gal $20.80 $20.66 $23.08
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46 Mayonnaise, Packets 200 - 9 gm $11.72 $8.90 $9.58

47 Mustard 4 - 1 gal $10.70 $10.54 $16.85

48 Mustard, Packets 500 - 5 gm $7.41 $5.84 $6.65

49 BBQ Sauce, Packets 500/12gm $16.04 NO BID $12.92

50 Pancake Syrup 4 - 1 gal $21.00 $22.10 $22.14

51 Pancake Syrup, Sugar Free 4 - 1 gal $23.62 $22.50 $20.20

52 Pepper, Black 12 – 1#  Units $57.84 $25.60 $8.24

53 Salt, Evaporated, Granulated 1 – 80# $11.08 $5.45 $5.68

54 Sweet Relish 4 - 1 gal $27.18 $26.10 $28.08

55 Italian Dressing , Packets 200 - 12gm $7.02 $6.40 $7.36

DESSERT

56 Apple Pie Filling 1 - 19# bucket $29.37 $21.95 $22.24

57 Banana Pudding 6 - #10 $26.57 $25.85 $27.79

58 Brownie Mix 6 - 5# $32.80 $31.70 $57.33

59 Butterscotch Pudding 6 - #10 $25.20 $25.85 $27.17

60 Cherry Pie Filling 1 - 19# bucket $43.91 $32.54 $32.53

61 Chocolate Cake Mix 6 - 5# $32.42 $31.50 $57.68

62 Chocolate Chip Cookies 1 - 10#          
Count Per Case $24.01 $27.40 $23.34

63 Chocolate Chips 25# box $37.27 $37.80 $61.53

64 Chocolate Pudding 6 - #10 $24.52 $24.30 $27.40

65 Dreamsicles 23 - 3 oz $19.83 NO BID $18.30

66 Fudgesicles 23 - 3 oz $19.83 NO BID $18.09

67 Gelatin, Assorted Citrus 12 - 24 oz $25.40 $24.85 $29.07

68 Gelatin, Assorted Red 12 - 24 oz $25.40 $24.85 $29.07

69 Lemon Pie Filling 1 - 38# bucket $42.97 $20.70 NO BID

70 Marshmallows, Mini $18.91 NO BID $18.88

71 Oatmeal Cookies 1 - 10#         
Count Per Case $21.18 $27.40 $20.48

72 Pie Shells 20 - 10 in $23.39 $28.20 $25.12

73 Pudding Mix 12 - 24 oz pouch $25.96 $25.50 $41.38
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74 Pumpkin Mix 6 - #10 $40.38 $51.50 $43.54

75 Rice Pudding 6 - #10        
Count Per Case $27.53 $27.65 $32.07

76 Sugar Cookies 1 - 10#          
Count Per Case $20.74 $27.40 $19.40

77 Sweet Tart Shells 1 - 72 ct $21.00 $24.50 $20.99

78 Tapioca Pudding 6 - #10 $28.52 $26.00 $27.73

79 Vanilla Pudding 6 - #10 $24.47 $24.38 $27.44

80 White Cake Mix 6 - 5# $29.76 $28.75 $55.74

81 Yellow Cake Mix 6 - 5# $29.76 $28.75 $26.91

DRY GOODS

82 Baking Powder 1 – 5# $41.71 $13.05 $7.30

83 Baking Soda 24  – 1# $17.63 $15.80 $15.90

84 Cocoa 1 – 5# $104.20 $23.45 $26.55

85 Coconut, Fine Shred 1 – 10# $21.31 $28.45 $22.10

86 Corn Starch 1 – 25# $16.50 $17.60 $17.09

87 Flour, White, All Purpose 1 – 50# $13.99 $15.65 $15.38

88 Sugar, Brown Light 1 – 50# $32.38 $34.90 $40.78

89 Sugar, Confectioner 1 – 50# $33.71 $34.05 $41.63

90 Sugar, White, Granulated 1 – 50# $29.56 $32.50 $37.27

91 Bread Crumbs 2 - 7.5lb $19.44 NO BID $18.39

MISCELLANEOUS

92 Apple Butter 6 – 10# $21.86 $52.60 $36.39

93 Barley, Pearly 12 – 1# $16.95 $22.25 $19.62

94 Biscuits 240 – 2.2 oz $38.65 $21.55 $28.14

95 Cranberry Sauce 6 – 10# $37.32 $41.25 $38.99

96 Dressing, French 4 – 1 gal $39.59 $24.71 $32.23

97 Dressing, Italian 4 – 1 gal $31.83 $21.48 $21.56

98 FF Oil 1 – 5 gal $22.36 $17.95 Weekly Quote

99 French Fries, McCain, Invisicoat 6 – 5# $39.74 $31.20 $34.77
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100 Grape Jelly 6 – 10# $59.28 $61.30 $54.01

101 Horseradish 1 – 1 gal $55.75 $5.85 $12.78

102 Molasses $51.47 No Bid $45.40

103 Peanut Butter 6 – 5# $46.63 $44.95 $57.74

104 Quaker Sandwich Slices 32 – 3 oz $37.00 Weekly Quote NO BID

105 Rice 1 – 25# $14.00 $13.45 $15.38

106 Saltine Crackers 240 – 4 pk $7.45 $10.70 $13.18

107 Sauerkraut 6 – 10# $26.46 $25.90 $36.11

108 Soy Bean Oil 1 – 5 gal $18.81 $17.95 Weekly Quote

109 Soy Sauce 4 – 1 gal $18.04 $19.10 $41.18

110 Taco Shells 1 – 200 ct $17.62 $14.85 $16.26

111 Vanilla Flavoring 1 gal $22.65 $6.85 $24.88

112 Vegalene Pan Coating, Pure Vegetable, No 
Preservatives, Alcohol, or Water 64 fl oz / ½ gal $20.25 NO BID $22.01

113 Vinegar, Apple Cider 4 – 1 gal $12.42 $8.80 $9.41

114 Vinegar, White 4 – 1 gal $7.70 $7.35 $7.74

115 Worcestershire Sauce 4 – 1 gal $18.00 $21.25 $30.90

116 Dry Ranch Dressing Packet 3.12 oz. packs $44.45 NO BID $28.40

PASTA

117 Noodle, Pot Pie, Frozen 2 in 1 – 15# $33.18 NO BID NO BID

118 Noodles, Elbow 1 – 20# $14.00 $13.75 $19.47

119 Noodles, Lasagna 12 – 1# $11.83 $13.85 $17.81

120 Noodles, Medium 1 – 10# $17.07 $12.40 $17.69

121 Pizza Crust 18 – 12 x 16 $23.35 $19.05 $42.10

122 Pizza Sauce, Cans 6 – #10 $30.67 $21.95 $22.17

123 Ravioli, Beef, Cans 6 – #10 $34.15 $36.60 $35.41

124 Rotini Pasta 1 – 20# $16.54 $14.75 $19.47

125 Spaghetti, #10 Cut 1 – 20# $16.09 $14.75 $19.47

126 Ziti 1 – 20# $16.54 $14.75 $19.47
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SNACKS

127 Chips, Corn 6 – 1# $16.54 Weekly Quote $26.83

128 Chips, Potato, BBQ 4 – 1# $17.78 weekly Quote NO BID

129 Chips, Potato, Ripple 4 – 1# $18.78 Weekly Quote $18.74

130 Chips, Potato Snacks, Bachman or Equal, 
Regular, Sour Cream & Onion, BBQ 60 - 1 oz. $32.00 Weekly Quote $29.33

131 Pretzels, Bag $15.20 Weekly Quote $15.78

132 Pretzels, Loose $21.92 Weekly Quote $9.83

SPICES

133 Basil, Whole 1 – 24 oz  Unit $46.58 $12.00 $19.47

134 Cayenne Pepper Ground 1 – 1#  Unit $33.97 $3.95 $7.46

135 Celery Seed, Whole 1 – 1#  Unit $28.09 $4.25 $7.83

136 Chili Powder 1 – 1#  Unit $28.44 $4.25 $8.37

137 Cinnamon, Ground 1 – 24 oz  Unit $40.51 $4.70 $4.84

138 Crushed Red Pepper 1 – 1#  Unit $37.68 $4.20 $8.12

139 Cumin, Ground 1 – 1#  Unit $51.81 $4.85 $9.82

140 Fennel Seeds 1 – 1#  Unit $49.24 $4.25 $10.46

141 Garlic Powder 1 – 1#  Unit $41.71 $4.20 $5.14

142 Mustard, Ground 1 – 1#  Unit $30.36 $4.25 $6.90

143 Nutmeg, Ground 1 – 1#  Unit $81.64 $13.00 $15.61

144 Onion Powder 1 – 1#  Unit $28.67 $4.25 $7.01

145 Oregano 1 – 24 oz  Unit $60.02 $9.90 $14.13

146 Paprika 1 – 1# Unit $29.98 $3.85 $4.34

147 Parsley Flakes 1 – 24 oz Unit $26.40 $10.25 $6.96

148 Sage, Rub 1 – 1#  Unit $58.62 $4.85 $10.15

149 Thyme 1 – 1#  Unit $53.33 $4.72 $7.68

FISH

150 Crab, Imitation 30# cs $58.40 $54.50 $40.21

151 Pollock, Breaded, Oven Ready, Pre-Browned 46 – 3.6 oz $50.56 $27.80 $44.63

152 Pollock, Nuggets, Chopped Formed,  Pre-
Browned, Oven Ready 189 - .85 oz $61.57 $29.85 $31.63
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153 Pollock, Sknls, Bnls, Tails, Fillets 4 – 10# Random 
2 – 4 oz. 2.36 lb $22.90 $29.45

154 Tuna, Light Chunk, In Water 6 – 66, 5 oz $48.54 $42.35 $42.29

MEAT

155 Beef Base, Powder 12 – 1# $21.91 $30.10 $23.91

156 Beef, Dried, Chipped 3# bx $214.05 Weekly Quote $24.84

157 Beef, Ground (no variety meats, no  organs, no 
tongue) 1 – 5# tube/pk Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

158 Beef, Liver 40 – 4 oz $24.32 Weekly Quote $29.10

159 Bologna, Lebanon, Fresh 2 – 10# 4.68 lb Weekly Quote 4.66 lb

160 Chicken Base, Powder 12 – 1# $21.44 $29.75 $21.23

161 Chicken, Breaded, Round Patty,                                  
Pre-Browned, Oven Ready 60 – 2.5 oz $30.86 $19.65 $20.86

162 Chicken, Breast, Bnls, Sknls, 40# Random Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

163 Chicken, Breast, Bnls, Sknls, Random 40# bx Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

164 Chicken, Nuggets, Pre-Browned,                                   
Oven Ready 215 - .74 oz $35.85 $22.50 $21.37

165 Chicken, Patty Sub Shaped,                                                
Pre-Browned, Oven Ready 42 – 3.7 oz $29.34 $54.55 NO BID

166 Chicken, Tenders, Random Fritters 10# $18.81 $18.00 $29.73

167 Vegetable Base 12 – 1# $13.31 $27.45 $29.30

168 Hamburger, Patties 3.5 oz / 5# bx $33.40 Weekly Quote $40.60

169 Meatballs, All Beef, Oven Ready,                                   
Pre-Baked or Fried 1 oz. 140 – 160 $31.30 Weekly Quote $41.02

170 Rib-A-Ques    (no pork) 53 – 3 oz $92.24 $32.50 NO BID

171 Salisbury Steaks 48 – 4 oz $40.70 Weekly Quote $43.56

172 Sausage, Links, Hot Italian 5# bx $34.59 weekly Quote $34.80

173 Top Round 20# pk avg. Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

174 Turkey, Bologna 2 – 10# 1.31 lb 1.95 lb. Weekly Quote

175 Turkey, Frank    8 – 1 , 80 pc. – 
10# $12.60 1.42 lb $16.13

176 Turkey, Fully Cooked, White Meat Added, 
Fresh 2 – 5# 2.82 lb 1.85 lb Weekly Quote

177 Turkey, Ground 1 – 10# tube .80 / lb $15.70 $15.84

178 Turkey, Ham, 20% Water, Chunked and 
Formed, Fresh 2 – 5# 2.73 lb 2.35 lb 2.69 lb
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179 Turkey, Salami 2 – 10# 1.21 lb 1.85lb Weekly Quote

180 Turkey, Sausage 1 oz link, 10# bx 2.59 lb $29.40 $25.92

181 Turkey, Whole Breast, Bone In 16 – 18# avg. 1.96 lb 1.99 lb. $1.81

182 Veal, Patties 4 oz - 10# bx $40.90 Weekly Quote $43.24

CHEESE

183 Cheddar, Cheese Sauce Mix 8 – 32 oz $50.51 $48.80 $64.33

184 Cheese, American, 160 Pre-Sliced 4 – 5# Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

185 Cheese, Cheddar, Sauce 6 – 10# $36.81 $31.40 $42.55

186 Cheese, Imitation Cheddar Shredded 4 – 5# NO BID NO BID Weekly Quote

187 Cheese, Parmesan, Capri, Grated 4 -1 gal Weekly Quote $61.85 Weekly Quote

188 Cheese, Shredded Cheddar 4 – 5# Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

189 Cheese, Shredded Mozzarella, Part Skim 6 – 5# Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

DAIRY

190 Cottage Cheese, Small Curd 1 - 5# $34.64 Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

191 Eggs, Fresh, Medium, “AA” 1 - 30 doz $42.44 Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

192 Ice Cream, 3 gal $20.94 NO BID $20.69

193 Ice Cream, Peanut Butter Cup 3 gal NO BID NO BID $35.85

194 Ice Cream, Peanut Butter Ripple 3 gal $19.33 NO BID $19.90

195 Ice Cream, Strawberry 3 gal $23.22 NO BID $22.24

196 Ice Milk, Chocolate 96 - 4 oz $8.68 NO BID $7.96

197 Ice Milk, Vanilla 96 - 4 oz $8.68 NO BID $7.96

198 Margarine 30 - 1# $23.67 $19.10 $27.83

199 Milk, 2%, Plastic Jug gal NO BID NO BID Weekly Quote

200 Milk, Whole, Carton 8 oz NO BID NO BID Weekly Quote

201 Sherbet, Orange 96 - 4 oz $6.56 NO BID $13.48

202 Sherbet, Rainbow 1 - 3 gal $15.52 NO BID $17.94

203 Sour Cream 1 - 5# $22.66 Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

204 Whip Topping, Rich’s RTU 12 – 32 oz $39.68 $46.85 $40.56
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POTATOES

205 Hash Browns, Frozen 210 ct $27.07 $29.00 $36.22

206 Potatoes, Chef 50# Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

207 Potatoes, Diced 6 – 10# $24.45 $23.85 $28.45

208 Potatoes, Instant, Complete w/Vitamin C 6 – 10# $58.11 $54.20 $51.85

209 Potatoes, Scalloped 6 – 38 oz $60.30 $60.95 $55.83

210 Potatoes, Sweet 6 – 10# $36.85 $35.20 $35.19

211 Potatoes, Unclass 50# Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

VEGETABLES

212 Beans, Great Northern 6 – 10# $24.90 $25.95 $24.83

213 Beans, Green Frozen 1 – 20# $14.45 $13.95 $33.63

214 Beans, Kidney 6 – 10# $24.68 $20.80 $21.32

215 Beans, Lima Baby $24.90 $23.99 $38.99

216 Beans, Vegetarian 6 – 10# $23.10 $21.28 $21.37

217 Beets, Sliced 6 – 10# $21.17 $20.10 $27.90

218 Bell peppers, Green, Medium / Large 1 - 25# Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

219 Black Beans, Dried 25# box $18.05 $21.40 $17.05

220 Broccoli, Chopped 1 – 20# $26.47 $16.95 $27.93

221 Carrots, Frozen, Grade A,B 1 – 20# $13.41 $13.09 $34.40

222 Carrots, Loose 50# cs Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

223 Cauliflower 1 – 20# $20.08 $14.95 $25.10

224 Corn, Cream 6 – 10# $27.79 $31.30 $32.26

225 Corn, Frozen 1 – 20# $17.05 $16.60 $31.00

226 Mixed Vegetables, Grade A 1 – 20# $14.98 $14.45 $29.95

227 Onions, Chopped Dehydrated 1 – 10# $34.83 $38.20 $47.62

228 Peas, Frozen 1 – 20# $18.48 $15.94 $34.61

229 Peppers, Diced, Frozen 12 - 2#              
24# case $30.97 $19.95 $23.95

230 Tomatoes, Diced 6 – 10# $18.61 $19.82 $22.54
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PRODUCE

231 Apples, McIntosh, V 100 ct Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

232 Banana, Petite, Green Tip 1 -150 ct Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

233 Cabbage, Red 8 -  5# Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

234 Cabbage, White 50# (bag or box) Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

235 Cantaloupes 1 - 12 ct Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

236 Celery 1 - 24 ct Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

237 Honeydew 1 - 12 ct Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

238 Lettuce, Head, Iceberg 24 ct Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

239 Lettuce, Salad, Chopped, Carrots, Purple 
Cabbage 4 - 5# Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

240 Lettuce, Shredded, 1/8” 4 - 5# Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

241 Onions, Spanish 50# Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

242 Oranges, California 1 - 113 ct Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote

243 Tomatoes, 6 x 6, Large 1 cs                             
(60 - 68 each) Weekly Quote Weekly Quote Weekly Quote
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