Envelopes January to June 2021.xls

ENVELOPES - BLANK & PREPRINTED QUOTE SUMMARY
January 1, 2021 - June 30, 2021

Jayden Graphics Inc.

CRABAR GBF INC.

BLANK PRE-PRINTED BLANK PRE-PRINTED

X X Price Per Price Per . Price Per Price Per

ITEM DESCRIPTION Quantity ] Price Per 1000 1000 Lot Price Per 1000 1000 Lot
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 1,000 NO BID S 96.29 || $ 96.29 $ 27.80 S 56.53 [ S 56.53
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 2,500 NO BID S 51.75([S 129.38] $ 22.83 S 39.65 [ S 99.13
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 5,000 NOBID || || $ 43.00( S 21500 $ 22,10 |[|f S 32.93(|S 164.66
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 7,500 NO BID S 39.54([S 296.85] $ 21.75 S 30.62|[S 229.67
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 10,000 NO BID S 37.68|[S 376.80] $ 21.41 S 29.27||S 292.66
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 25,000 NO BID S 29.71|[S 74275} $ 20.06 S 25.95||S 648.68
#9 Regular Envelopes - White 50,000 NO BID S 2455([S 1,22750 $ 19.03 S 24.14 || S 1,206.89
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 1,000 NOBID ||| $ 95.77(|S 95.77} S 22.33|[|f S 55.78 || S 55.78
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 2,500 NOBID ||| $ 54.86|[S 137.15] S 22.33|[|f S 39.05 | S 97.63
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 5,000 NOBID ||| $ 43.78 (S 218900 $ 21.61 |[|[ S 3240 S 162.00
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 7,500 NOBID || || $ 4038 S 30285 S 21.27 [ S 30.11 (S 225.86
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 10,000 NOBID || || $ 39.52([S 395.20Q $ 20.94 |[|[ S 28.77||S 287.73
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 25,000 NOBID || || $ 29.43|[S 73575 S 19.63 ||| $ 25.50||S 637.48
#10 Regular Envelopes - White 50,000 NOBID |||l § 2479||S 1,239.50 $ 18.61 ||| S 23.72 || $ 1,185.85
#10 Window Envelopes - White 1,000 NO BID S 227.44||S 227.44Q S 24.33 S 57.78 || S 57.78
#10 Window Envelopes - White 2,500 NO BID S 112.65(S 281.63f S 24.33 S 41.05( S 102.63
#10 Window Envelopes - White 5,000 NO BID S 77.35|[S 386.75] $ 23.61 S 3440(fS 172.00
#10 Window Envelopes - White 7,500 NO BID S 65.86|[S 493.95] $ 23.27 S 32.11 (S 240.83
#10 Window Envelopes - White 10,000 NO BID S 57.77||S 577.70} $ 22.94 S 30.77||S 307.70
#10 Window Envelopes - White 25,000 NO BID S 40.41 (| $ 1,010.25) $ 21.63 S 27.50||S 687.50
#10 Window Envelopes - White 50,000 NO BID S 33.35([ S 1,667.50 ] $ 20.61 S 25.72 || S 1,286.00
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White 1,000 NOBID ||| $ 137.07||S 137.07] S 49.17 ||| S 96.03 |[ S 96.03
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White 2,500 NOBID|[]| $ 85.57||S 213.931 $ 49.17 ||| S 71.25(s 178.13
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White 5,000 NOBID|[]| $ 7450 S 37250Q S 47.58 ||| S 60.96 [ S 304.82
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White 7,500 NOBID ||| $ 71.09|S 533.18Q S 46.83 ||| S 57.37||S 430.30
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White || 10,000 NOBID|[]| $ 7024 || S 702.40Q S 46.09 ||| S 55.19[S 551.88
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White |[ 25,000 NOBID || || $ 60.14 |[ S 1,503.50 | S 43.20 |[|[ S 49,55 || $ 1,238.75
#10 Quick strip Envelopes - White || 50,000 NOBID ||| $ 55.51 || S 2,775.50 | S 40.97 |||l S 46.30 || $ 2,315.08
#10 Regular Envelopes - lvory 1,000 NO BID S 180.69 (S 180.69f S 90.33 S 157.78||S 157.78
#10 Regular Envelopes - Ivory 2,500 NO BID S 143.22 S 358.05f $ 90.33 S 120.65(S 301.78
#10 Regular Envelopes - Ivory 5,000 NO BID S 128.15(|[S 640.75§ $ 87.42 S 104.79 S 523.94
#10 Regular Envelopes - lvory 7,500 NO BID S 124.75|[S 93563 $ 86.03 S 99.19 [ S 743.95
#10 Regular Envelopes - Ivory 10,000 NO BID S 123.89 ([ S 1,23890f $ 84.69 S 95.71|[$ 957.11
#10 Regular Envelopes - lvory 25,000 NO BID S 107.51 ([ S 2,687.75§ $ 79.38 S 86.45 [ S 2,161.20
#10 Regular Envelopes - lvory 50,000 NO BID S 102.00 [[ S 5,100.00 | $ 75.28 S 80.95 [ S 4,047.51
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 1,000 NOBID |||l § 166.25(S 166.25] $ 41795 ||| S 460.35|| S 460.35
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 2,500 NOBID |||l § 83.45(S 208631 S 188.95 |[|[ S 207.40 (S 518.50
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 5,000 NOBID |||l § 6291||S 31455) S 118.95 |[|[ S 129.15||S 645.75
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 7,500 NOBID |||l § 55.79||S 418.43} S 117.75 |[|[ S 128.35|S 962.62
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 10,000 NOBID |||l § 52.22||S 1,662.50 $ 73.25 ||| S 79.50|[S 795.00
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 25,000 NOBID |||l § 38.73||S 968.25] $ 45.60 |[|[ S 49.75 || $ 1,243.75
6x9 Booklet Envelopes - White 50,000 NOBID |||l § 3427 ||S 1,713.50Q $ 3030 ||| S 41.75 || $ 2,087.50

Vendor Contact Information:

Rep: Craig Martin

Rep: William J. Reid

Phone: 972-838-2000

Phone: 470-235-0676

Fax: 214-973-5499

Fax: 800-645-8339

Email: craig_martin@jaydengraphics.com

Email: bill_reid@crabargbf.com
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