Kitchen Quote Summary
July 1, 2020 - September 30,2020

Prison
FEESERS INC KEYCO DIST INC ECOLAB INC
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT ITEM # UNIT cost || MINIMUM NOTES UNIT mem# || unimcost | MINIMUM NOTES UNIT ITEM # UNIT COST MINIMUM/ NOTES
SHIPPING SHIPPING Py

12 0z, STYROFOAM BOWLS 500/CS 533688 $26.28 500/CS $25.70 500/CS No Quote

12 0Z, STYROFOAM BOWLS PLASTIC LIDS 1000/CS 537886 <2474 1000/CS 2430 1000/CS No Quote

120z. ALADDIN TEMP RITE INSULATED BOWL LID 1000 pk No Bid 1000 pk No Quote 1000 pk No Quote

3 COMPARTMENT STYROFOAM HINGED TRAY 200/CT 540547 $15.99 200/CT $15.75 200/CT No Quote

8 OZ STYROFOAM CUPS PLASTIC LIDS 1000/CS 537424 $14.73 1000/CS $14.55 1000/CS No Quote

8 07, STYROFOAM CUPS 1000/CS 534991 $22.77 1000/CS $22.50 1000/CS No Quote

80z. ALADDIN TEMP RITE INSULATED CUP LID 2000 pk 537476 3317 2000 pk No Quote 2000 pk No Quote
ALUMINUM FOIL, 18 IN X 1000 FT, 535933 $43.21 $42.35 No Quote

BEARD SNOODS BAG 536981 No Quote 10/100 ct BAG No Quote BAG No Quote

BLEACH 4/1 GALLON 243719 $13.80 6/1gal 4/1 GALLON $13.45 6/1gl GA4LL10N No Quote

DW HAND LIQUID POT & PAN DETERGENT 4/1 GALLON 240807 $29.66 4/1 GALLON $28.85 4/1gl GA‘:./L];:JN 6110906 $117.24

DW MACH SOLID POWER XL DETERGENT 4/91B On Contract 4/91B No Quote 4/91B 6100185 $116.10 4/91bs
HAIRNETS (BOUFFANT CAPS) BAG 536980 $10.69 paipec BAG $4.10 BO0cy BAG No Quote

144 ct BOUFFANT

HOT PADS 8.5 X11 EA 533454 $48.60 1/12ct EA No Quote EA No Quote

LIQUID POT & PAN DETERGENT 4/1 GALLON 240807 $29.66 4/1 GALLON $28.85 4/1gl gAT./LION 6110906 $117.24

LUNCH, BROWN PAPER BAGS, #6 500 CT 530368 $11.69 500 CT $11.75 500 CT No Quote

PAN SCRUBBERS, 3.5 X 5" 20/BX 411828 $16.98 4/10ct 20/BX $14.35 60 ct 20/BX No Quote

PLASTIC APRONS, 24X46 PK 530121 $5.56 ngf bxmo PK $5.00 100 ct PK No Quote

PLASTIC FORKS, MEDIUM WEIGHT 1000/CS 536397 $8.35 1000/CS $9.42 1000/CS No Quote

PLASTIC GLOVES PK 536855 $5.27 1,000 ct bx PK $48.00 10,000 PK No Quote

PLASTIC KNIVES, MEDIUM WEIGHT 1000/CS 537249 $8.35 1000/CS $9.42 1000/CS No Quote

PLASTIC SANDWICH BAGS 6% X 73/8 1000/CS 530680 $13.68 25;); ZS 1000/CS No Quote 2,000 1000/CS No Quote

PLASTIC SPOONS, MEDIUM WEIGHT 1000/CS 540984 $8.35 1000/CS $9.42 1000/CS No Quote

PLASTIC SPORKS, MEDIUM WT. 1000 CS 523360 $8.35 1000 CS $7.55 1000 CS No Quote

PLASTIC WRAP, 18 X 3000 FT 540520 $31.22 $28.95 No Quote

POLY, APRONS 1000/CS 530121 $50.51 1000/CS $5.00 100 1000/CS No Quote

POLY, PLASTIC GLOVES, LARGE 1000/CS 536855 $47.65 10/1,000 cs 1000/CS $48.00 10,000 1000/CS No Quote
POLYCARBONATE BOWLS No Quote No Quote No Quote
POLYCARBONATE PLATES No Quote No Quote No Quote

RINSE SOLID BRILLANCE 1/2.5GL On Contract 1/2.5GL No Quote 1/2.5GL 6125395 $187.78

SANIT MULTI-QUAT OASIS SANITIZER 1/2.5GL On Contract 1/2.5GL No Quote 1/2.56GL 6100536 $81.68
STAINLESS STEEL SCRUBBERS 1.75 0Z 12/cs 411933 $31.68 6/12¢s 12/cs $5.80 12ct 12/cs No Quote

WHITE BEARD NETS 1000/CS 536981 No Quote 1000/CS No Quote 1000/CS No Quote

WHITE HAIRNETS (BOUFFANT CAPS) 1000/CS 927871 $35.34 1000/CS $4.10 100 ct 1000/CS No Quote

Rep: Todd Moyer Rep: Thomas Bogdon Rep: Dale Mrozinski
Phone: 800-326-2828 x1432 Phone: 570-332-0334 Phone: 952-852-2409
Vendor Contact Information: Fax: 717-558-7476 Fax: 570-696-3065 Fax: 651-306-5429
Email: tmoyer@feesers.com Email: zosodP@aol.com Email: Gov.sales@ecolab.com




Kitchen Quote Summary
July 1, 2020 - September 30, 2020

Pre-Release Center

FEESERS INC KEYCO DIST INC ECOLAB INC
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT ITEM # uniTcost || MINIMUM - ores UNIT mem# || unitcost | MINMUM ores UNIT ITEM # uniT cost || MINIMUMI - ores
SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING
12 0Z, STYROFOAM BOWLS 500/Cs 533688 $26.28 500/Cs $25.70 500/Cs NO BID
12 0Z, STYROFOAM BOWLS PLASTIC LIDS 1000/CS 537886 $24.74 1000/CS $24.30 1000/CS NO BID
9 INCH STYROFOAM PLATES 540087 $14.10 s B0 e NO BID
18" FILM WRAP 18"X3M' 540520 $31.22 18"X3M' $28.95 18"X3M' NO BID
3 COMPARTMENT CONTAINERS 200/CT 543613 $15.99 200/CT $15.75 200/CT NO BID
6 COMPARTMENT TRAY, 10X14 5/32 X 1 5/32 543480 NO BID 4/125ct NOBID | 4/125ct NO BID
8 0Z STYROFOAM CUPS PLASTIC LIDS 1000/CS 537424 $14.73 1000/CS $14.55 1000/CS NO BID
8 0Z, STYROFOAM CUPS 1000/CS 534991 $22.77 1000/CS $22.50 1000/CS NO BID
ALUMINUM FOIL, 18 IN X 304.8 FT, #282 535933 $43.21 1,000 ft $42.35 1,000 ft NO BID
BASTING BRUSHES, PASTRY, 2” NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
BASTING BRUSHES, PASTRY, 3” NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
BLEACH 243719 $13.80 6/1 GALLON $13.45 6/1 GALLON NO BID
BOWLS, 12.5 0Z 531329 s3232 || Ozi/ 125 nosiD || 2 Oth/ 125 NO BID
BRILLO SOAP PADS 10/BX 411892 $24.53 12/10 bx 10/BX NOBID || 12/10bx 10/BX NO BID
COMET LIQUID CLEANSER, 32 0Z 243868 $43.05 10/320z 84245 | 1073202 NO BID
DISH DETERGENT 3/1GALLON || 240807 $29.66 4/1gal 3/1 GALLON $28.85 4/1gal 3/1 GALLON NO BID
DISHWASHER DETERGENT, SOAP & RINSE, ECOLAB EA ON Contract EA NO BID EA 6112716 $92.94
DRINKING CUPS, POLYCARBONATE 8 0Z 48/Cs NO BID 48/Cs NO BID 48/Cs NO BID
FOOD CONTAINERS, COMBO % SIZE X 4 6.30 QT NO BID NO BID NO BID
HOT PADS, 11X 8 1/3 533454 $48.60 1/12ct NO BID 1/12ct NO BID
LUNCH, BROWN PAPER BAGS, #6 500 CT 530368 $11.69 500 CT $11.75 500 CT NO BID
NAPKINS, TALL FOLD DISPENSER 20/PK 538783 $28.86 16/ 625 ct 20/PK $27.90 || 16/625ct 20/PK NO BID
PLASTIC FORKS, MEDIUM WEIGHT 1000/CS 536397 $8.35 1000/CS 1000/CS $9.42 1000/CS 1000/CS NO BID




FEESERS INC KEYCO DIST INC ECOLAB INC
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT ITEM # uniT cost || MINIMUM NOTES UNIT mEM# || uniTcosT || VINIMUM NOTES UNIT ITEM # uniT cost || MINIMUMI \ores
SHIPPING SHIPPING SHIPPING
PLASTIC GLOVES, POLY DISPOSABLE BX 536855 $5.27 1,000 / box BX $48.00 || 1,000/ box BX NO BID
PLASTIC KETCHUP & MUSTARD CONTAINERS, 12 0Z EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
PLASTIC KNIVES, MEDIUM WEIGHT 1000/CS 537249 $8.35 1000/CS $9.42 1000/CS NO BID
PLASTIC SPOONS, MEDIUM WEIGHT 1000/CS 540984 $8.35 1000/CS $9.42 1000/CS NO BID
PLASTIC SPORKS, MEDIUM WEIGHT, #BS500 1000/CS 523360 $8.35 #BS500 1000/CS $7.55 #BS500 1000/CS NO BID
POLY SANDWICH BAGS, 6.5 X 8.5 2000 CT 530680 $13.68 6.5x7 2000 CT NO BID 6.5x7 2000 CT NO BID
REYNOLDS PLASTIC WRAP, 2000 FT 540520 $31.22 GETR? 3000 $28.95 GETREf[t)' 3000 NO BID
RINSE ULTRA DRY 1/4.5 GL ON Contract 1/4.5 GL NO BID 1/4.5 GL 6115172 $181.28
SCOUT DETERGENT, ECOLAB ON Contract NO BID 6110906 $117.24
SERVING SPOONS, GRIP-N-SERVE, 14” EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
SINK SANITIZER, ECOLAB, OASIS ON Contract NO BID 6100536 $81.68
SOLID BREAK PLUS DETERGENT BOOSTER 4/6 LB ON Contract 4/6 B NO BID 4/6 B 6101759 $60.48
SOLID NAVISOFT FABRIC SOFTENER/SOUR 2/61B ON Contract 2/618 NO BID 2/618 6116001 $137.46
PARCHMENT PAPER 539010 36.52 e $36.40 o NO BID
SPATULAS, 10" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
SPATULAS, 14” EA 533503 $23.08 13" EA NO BID 13" EA NO BID
STAINLESS STEEL SCRUBBERS 1.75 OZ 12/cs 411933 $31.68 6/ 12/cs 12/cs $5.80 6/ 12/cs 12/cs NO BID
WHITE BEARD NETS, LIGHT WEIGHT 144 536981 NO BID 10/100 ct 144 NOBID [ 10/100ct 144 NO BID
WHITE HAIRNETS (BOUFFANT CAPS), LIGHT WEIGHT 144 927871 $35.34 1/1,000 ct 144 $4.10 1/100ct 144 NO BID

Vendor Contact Information:

Rep: Todd Moyer

Phone: 800-326-2828 x1432

Fax: 717-558-7476

Email: tmoyer@feesers.com

Rep: Thomas Bogdon

Phone: 570-332-0334
Fax: 570-696-3065

Email: zosodP@aol.com

Rep: Dale Mrozinski
Phone: 952-852-2409

Fax: 651-306-5429

Email: Gov.sales@ecolab.com




Kitchen Quote Summary

July 1, 2020 - September 30, 2020

Courts / District Attorney

FEESERS INC KEYCO DIST INC ECOLAB INC
MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT ITEM# [ UNIT COST SHIPPING NOTES UNIT ITEM # [ UNIT COST SHIPPING NOTES UNIT ITEM# ([ UNIT COST SHIPPING NOTES
COFFEE PACKS, SINGLES, 12 CUP SERVINGS, CAFFEINATED 32 / CASE 143274 $57.63 96/1.50z 32 / CASE NO BID 32 / CASE NO BID
COFFEE PACKS, SINGLES, 12 CUP SERVINGS, DECAFF 32 / CASE 142176 $49.67 95/150z 32/ CASE NO BID 32/ CASE NO BID
CREAMER - NON DAIRY CANISTERS 12 OZ 24 / CASE || 223203 $38.56 24 / CASE NO BID 24 / CASE NO BID
CUP-HOT80Z 1000 / CASE|| 534991 $22.77 1000 / CASE NO BID 1000 / CASE NO BID
CUP - PAPER 10 OZ 50 / BOX 533990 $107.22 20/91?;0 i 50 / BOX NO BID 50 / BOX NO BID
STIR STIXS 300/BOX || 541649 $1.83 1,000 / bx 300/ BOX NO BID 300 / BOX NO BID
STYROFOAM CUPS, 12 OZ PK 535096 $31.49 40/ 25 ct PK NO BID PK NO BID
SUGAR - CANISTERS 20 0Z EA 700626 NO BID 24 /20 0z EA NO BID EA NO BID
TEA BAGS - WRAPPED DECAF PEKOE BLACK TEA 100 /BOX || 150722 $19.22 5/ 100 bx 100 / BOX NO BID 100 / BOX NO BID
TEA BAGS - WRAPPED PEKOE BLACK TEA 100/BOX || 150652 $26.43 10/100 bx 100 / BOX NO BID 100 / BOX NO BID
WATER - 16.9 OZ BOTTLES 24 / CASE 152418 $6.30 35/cs 24 / CASE NO BID 24 / CASE NO BID

Vendor Contact Information:

Rep: Todd Moyer
Phone: 800-326-2828 x1432

Fax: 717-558-7476

Email: tmoyer@feesers.com

Rep: Thomas Bogdon
Phone: 570-332-0334

Fax: 570-696-3065

Email: zoSodP@aol.com

Rep: Dale Mrozinski
Phone: 952-852-2409
Fax: 651-306-5429

Email: Gov.sales@ecolab.com




Kitchen Quote Summary

July 1, 2020 - September 30, 2020
Resource Management Services

FEESERS INC KEYCO DIST INC ECOLAB INC
STTPPING 7
MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT ITEM # UNIT COST NOTES UNIT ITEM # UNIT COST NOTES UNIT ITEM # UNIT COST NOTES
SHIPPING SHIPPING ORDERS /
STYROFOAM SQUAT CUPS, 12 OZ. PK 535096 $31.49 40/ 25 ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
3-SECTION DIVIDED PLATES PK 539982 $14.10 1/125¢ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
COFFEE FILTERS PK PK No Quote PK No Quote
143274 $57.63 96/ 1.5 0z
COFFEE PACKS, SINGLES, 12-CUP SERVING, CAFFEINATED PK PK No Quote PK No Quote
CREAMER PACKETS PK 223250 $32.86 1/2,000 ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
DISH DETERGENT EA 240807 $29.66 4/1gal EA No Quote EA No Quote
DISHWASHER DETERGENT EA On Contract EA No Quote EA No Quote
FOAM PLATES PK 540087 $14.10 9"4/125ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
PAPER PLATES PK 539939 $10.34 6" 1/1,000 ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
PLASTIC FORKS, MEDIUM WEIGHT PK 536397 $8.35 1/1,000 ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
PLASTIC KNIVES, MEDIUM WEIGHT PK 537249 $8.35 1/ 1,000 ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
6" white
PLASTIC PLATES PK 540253 $39.86 PK No Quote PK No Quote
8/125ct
PLASTIC SPOONS, MEDIUM WEIGHT PK 540984 $8.35 1/1,000 ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
SANITARY FOOD SERVICE GLOVES PK 536855 $5.27 1/1,000 ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
STIR STIX PK 541649 $1.83 1/1,000 ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
SUGAR PACKETS PK 700625 $12.53 1/2,000 ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
WHITE, DISPOSABLE TABLECLOTHS, 40 X 72” PK 541921 $38.28 54 X 108" PK No Quote PK No Quote
WHITE, FOAM HINGED CARRYOUT CONTAINERS, 9 %” X9 %" X 3”
’ s N i T 543613 $15.99 2/100 ct PK No Quote PK No Quote
3 COMPARTMENT
WHITE, VINYL TABLECLOTHS, 40 X 72" PK No Quote PK No Quote PK No Quote

Vendor Contact Information:

Rep: Todd Moyer
Phone:800-326-2828 x1432
Fax: 717-558-7476

Email: tmoyer@feesers.com

Rep: Thomas Bogdon
Phone: 570-332-0334
Fax: 570-696-3065

Email: ZoSodP@aol.com

Contact: Dale Mrozinski
Email: Gov.sales@ecolab.com
Phone: 952-852-2409

Fax: 651-306-5429
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